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Endorsements, Influencers, and Reviews
ftc.gov/business-guidance/advertising-marketing/endorsements-influencers-reviews

If you use consumer reviews or endorsements in your marketing, are you meeting the
standards of both the FTC Act and complying with the specific prohibitions of the Rule on the
Use of Consumer Reviews and Testimonials? What about the FTC's Guides Concerning Use
of Endorsements and Testimonials in Advertising (Endorsement Guides), revised in 2023?
Get plain language guidance from the FTC related to reviews, social media influencers, and
for complying with the Consumer Review Fairness Act.

Plain Language Guidance

Consumer Review Fairness Act: What Businesses Need to Know

The Consumer Review Fairness Act protects consumers’ ability to share their honest
opinions about a business’s products, services, or conduct in any forum – and that includes
social media. The FTC has tips to help your company comply with the law.

Disclosures 101 for Social Media Influencers

Do you work with brands to recommend or endorse products? If so, you need to comply with
the law when making these recommendations. One key is to make a good disclosure of your
relationship to the brand. This brochure from FTC staff gives tips on when and how to make
good disclosures.

https://www.ftc.gov/business-guidance/advertising-marketing/endorsements-influencers-reviews
https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.ftc.gov%2Flegal-library%2Fbrowse%2Ffederal-register-notices%2F16-cfr-part-465-trade-regulation-rule-use-consumer-reviews-testimonials-final-rule&data=05%7C02%7Cchundycz%40ftc.gov%7Cfde2312dc3954187e1e608dcbc83094f%7C7302cabc5af5469baf17700007935a01%7C0%7C0%7C638592518194644961%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=7ajfkXuuILbJqMvoPsYUFfSPfOr8w681Mw1UKqGnlYA%3D&reserved=0
https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.ftc.gov%2Flegal-library%2Fbrowse%2Ffederal-register-notices%2F16-cfr-part-255-guides-concerning-use-endorsements-testimonials-advertising&data=05%7C02%7Cchundycz%40ftc.gov%7Cfde2312dc3954187e1e608dcbc83094f%7C7302cabc5af5469baf17700007935a01%7C0%7C0%7C638592518194653986%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=d8K5PUCmBzTSqE31%2BW%2Bwl%2FgNLkxViLAPClm6OSRvdNw%3D&reserved=0
https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.ftc.gov%2Fenforcement%2Fstatutes%2Fconsumer-review-fairness-act&data=05%7C02%7Cchundycz%40ftc.gov%7Cfde2312dc3954187e1e608dcbc83094f%7C7302cabc5af5469baf17700007935a01%7C0%7C0%7C638592518194663395%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=AMkE8EJE5A0Rb5ueN98JCWF0RxiUrA4XL6g0O%2F9X0RQ%3D&reserved=0
https://www.ftc.gov/business-guidance/resources/consumer-review-fairness-act-what-businesses-need-know
https://www.ftc.gov/business-guidance/resources/disclosures-101-social-media-influencers
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Featuring Online Customer Reviews: A Guide for Platforms

People who rely on online reviews of companies, products, and services should be getting
an accurate picture of what other consumers think. If you operate a website or platform that
features reviews, have processes in place to ensure those reviews truly reflect the feedback
received from genuine customers.

FTC's Endorsement Guides: What People Are Asking

Answers to questions people are asking about the FTC’s Endorsement Guides, including
information about disclosing material connections between advertisers and endorsers. The
brochure also addresses how those established consumer protection principles apply in
social media and influencer marketing.

Native Advertising: A Guide for Businesses

Marketers and publishers are using innovative methods to create, format, and deliver digital
advertising. One form is “native advertising,” content that bears a similarity to the news,
feature articles, product reviews, entertainment, and other material that surrounds it online.
But as native advertising evolves, are consumers able to differentiate advertising from other
content?

Soliciting and Paying for Online Reviews: A Guide for Marketers

Consumers rely on online reviews in deciding what to buy. But some businesses abuse that
trust by writing or procuring fake reviews or by paying supposedly independent websites for
good rankings. Is your company taking steps to avoid that kind of deception and
manipulation?

Use of Endorsements and Testimonials in Advertising

Resources

Soliciting and Paying for Online Reviews: A Guide for Marketers

Consumers rely on online reviews in deciding what to buy. But some businesses abuse that
trust by writing or procuring fake reviews or by paying supposedly independent websites for
good rankings. Is your company taking steps to avoid that kind of deception and
manipulation?

Featuring Online Customer Reviews: A Guide for Platforms

https://www.ftc.gov/business-guidance/resources/featuring-online-customer-reviews-guide-platforms
https://www.ftc.gov/business-guidance/resources/ftcs-endorsement-guides-what-people-are-asking
https://www.ftc.gov/business-guidance/resources/native-advertising-guide-businesses
https://www.ftc.gov/business-guidance/resources/soliciting-paying-online-reviews-guide-marketers
https://www.ftc.gov/business-guidance/resources/use-endorsements-testimonials-advertising
https://www.ftc.gov/business-guidance/resources/soliciting-paying-online-reviews-guide-marketers
https://www.ftc.gov/business-guidance/resources/featuring-online-customer-reviews-guide-platforms
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People who rely on online reviews of companies, products, and services should be getting
an accurate picture of what other consumers think. If you operate a website or platform that
features reviews, have processes in place to ensure those reviews truly reflect the feedback
received from genuine customers.

Legal Resources on Endorsements, Influencers, and Reviews

Cases

Closing Letters

Federal Register Notices

Public Statements

https://www.ftc.gov/legal-library/browse/cases-proceedings?sort_by=field_date&field_mission%5B29%5D=29&field_consumer_protection_topics=1407
https://www.ftc.gov/legal-library/browse/cases-proceedings/closing-letters?sort_by=field_date&field_mission%5B29%5D=29&field_consumer_protection_topics=1407
https://www.ftc.gov/legal-library/search?sort_by=field_date&field_legal_library_record_types%5B1469%5D=1469&field_mission%5B29%5D=29&field_consumer_protection_topics=1407
https://www.ftc.gov/legal-library/search?sort_by=field_date&field_legal_library_record_types%5B23%5D=23&field_legal_library_record_types%5B24%5D=24&field_legal_library_record_types%5B13%5D=13&field_legal_library_record_types%5B16%5D=16&field_mission%5B29%5D=29&field_consumer_protection_topics=1407

